
Supplier Luther Washington dba Media Centre Colliflower Inc
1 No Bid 44%
2 No Bid 40%
3 No Bid 40%
4 No Bid 35%
5 No Bid 35%
6 $3,082.50 $3,001.50
7 $46,707.50 $46,291.00
8 $64,000.00 $70,880.00
9 $27,087.50 $32,037.50

10 $14,777.50 $17,307.50
11 $19,812.50 $24,587.50
12 $8,462.50 $10,465.00

 Total $183,930.00 $204,570.00

REQUEST FOR BID NO. B-10000274 OPENED 08/16/24, 2:15 P.M.
PARKER HYDRAULIC HOSES AND FITTINGS, TERM CONTRACT
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